Tony Allen

Begin forwarded message:

From: Don Bock <dbock@kevlargofire.com>
Date: December 31, 2017 at 8:19:04 PM EST
To: anthonvallen79@gmail.com

Subject: Fwd: Afg
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PLEASE NOTE: FLORIDA HAS A VERY BROAD PUBLIC RECORDS LAW.
COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING BUSINESS TO OR FROM THE FIRE
DEPARTMENT OR EMS ARE PUBLIC RECORDS AVAILABLE TO THE
PUBLIC AND MEDIA UPON REQUEST. YOUR EMAIL COMMUNICATION
MAY BE SUBJECT TO PUBLIC DISCLOSURE.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Captain David Garrido <dgarrido@kevlargofire.com>
Date: December 31, 2017 at 1:11:02 PM EST

To: Chief Don Bock <dbock@kevlargofire.com>

Subject: Fwd: Afg

Here is Mike’s quote.



Captain David Garrido

Key Largo Fire Department
1 East Drive

Key Largo, FL 33037
305-451-2700
dearrido/wkeylargofire.com

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and
confidential information, including patient information protected by
federal and state privacy laws. It is intended only for the use of the person
(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the
original message.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Michael Penzotti <mpenzotti(@grantimastersinc.com>
Date: December 31, 2017 at 13:00:11 EST

To: Captain David Garrido <dgarrido(@kevlargofire.com>
Subject: Re: Afg

for either AFG or SAFER, each new project costs $2,600 OR
modify and resubmit costs $500 each.

1f we do more than 1 in the same year | can offer some type of
discount for the SAFER, I don't know what that will be until
applications open, so just budget the full amount and we can come
in lower for the second.

On Sun, Dec 31, 2017 at 12:45 PM, Captain David Garrido
<dgarrido@keylargofire.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Mike.

Can you give me a quote on writing the two grants? AFG and
SAFER?

That way I can present it to the district

Captain David Garrido

Key Largo Fire Department
I East Brive

Kev Largo, FL, 33037



305-451-2700
dearridof@kevlargofire.com

The information contained in this transmission may contain
privileged and confidential information, including patient
information protected by federal and state privacy laws. It is
intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email
and destroy all copies of the original message.

On Dec 30, 2017, at 12:25, Michael Penzotti
<mpenzotii@grantmastersinc.com> wrote:

[ can't do that portion of the job because I don't have
any legal connection to the dept, it has to be started
and submitted by an authorized dept. rep.

On Sat, Dec 30, 2017 at 12:13 PM, Captain David
Garrido <dgarrido(@kevlargofire.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Mike

We are applying for the afg grant to try to get two way
radios.

Vicky is out in medical leave so I asked my Chief to
see if they can grant you full rights to create and
submit the grant. I an waiting for his reply as he is
waiting for the commissioners reply.

My LT is gathering prices for the radios.

1 have carbon copied him on this email.

Respectfully,

Caeptain David Garrido

Key Largo Fire Department
1 East Drive

Kev Largo, FI. 33037
305-451-2700

dgarridowkeylargofire.com




The information contained in this transmission
may contain privileged and confidential
information, including patient information
protected by federal and state privacy laws. It is
intended only for the use of the person(s) named
above. If you are not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any review, dissemination,
distribution or duplication of this communication is
strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by reply email
and destroy all copies of the original message.

Michael Penzotti
716-531-0888

Grantmasters Inc.

Fax: 716-754-2538

4523 Porter Center Road
Lewiston, NY 14092
www.grantmastersinc.com
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Michael Penzotti
716-531-0888

Grantmasters Inc.

Fax: 716-754-2538

4523 Porter Center Road
Lewiston, NY 14092

www . granimastersinc.com
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